

Event Details

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	1
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time	Finish Time		
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT	08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT		

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS

Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States

Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300

Phone:

Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Event Description

New Shelterhouse Materials

General Comments

- Pricing must be listed in the unit requested, and must be inclusive of all applicable charges (i.e., shipping, reconditioning, installation and labor). Prices listed above and beyond what is requested shall not be considered and shall be reason to reject offer.
- As required by IC 4-13-2-14.8:
Notwithstanding any other law, rule, or custom, a person or company who has a contract with the State or submits invoices to the State for payment shall authorize in writing the direct deposit by electronic funds transfer of all payments by the State to the person or company. The written authorization must designate a financial institution and an account number to which all payments are to be credited. For forms and additional information see the State Comptroller's website at <https://www.in.gov/comptroller/forms/>
- Supplier must include shipping and/or any other additional costs in bid response. Shipping and/or additional costs will not be paid if added to invoice.
- To allow for sufficient processing time in compliance with Indiana State Law, all quoted prices offered to the State under this Solicitation Event must be valid for thirty (30) calendar days after the Response Due Date (aka Finish Time) listed above.

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	2
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name	New Shelterhouse Materials		
Start Time	Finish Time		
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT	08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT		

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Line Details

No Bid: ☐

Line: 1 Item ID: Line Qty: 75 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 75
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 8"x8"x16" - Concrete Cap Block

Comments:

- A new shelterhouse is to be built by property staff at Morgan Monroe State Forest. This is the first purchase to begin the process and includes materials for framing, block walls, and roofing.>>

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 2 Item ID: Line Qty: 850 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 850
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 8"x8"x16" - Reg Concrete Block

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	3
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time	Finish Time		
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT	08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT		

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

No Bid: ☐

Line: 3 Item ID: Line Qty: 500 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 500
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Brick Ties - WT22

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 4 Item ID: Line Qty: 75 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 75
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Miam/rich Mort Type S - 75#

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 5 Item ID: Line Qty: 25 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 25
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 2'x4'x10' - #1 Syp Treated GC

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	4
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name	New Shelterhouse Materials		
Start Time	Finish Time		
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT	08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT		

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 6	Item ID:	Line Qty: 25	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty: 25
Required: No	Reserve Price: No				

Description: 2'x6'x16' - construction spf

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 7	Item ID:	Line Qty: 25	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty: 25
Required: No	Reserve Price: No				

Description: 2'x8'x16' - #1 yellow pine

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	5
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time		Finish Time	
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT		08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT	

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

No Bid: ☐

Line: 8 Item ID: Line Qty: 50 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 50
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 2'x6'x16' - #1 syp treated GC

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 9 Item ID: Line Qty: 50 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 50
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 2'x8'x16' - #1 syp treated GC

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 10 Item ID: Line Qty: 25 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 25
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 2'x12'x16' - #1 syp treated GC

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	6
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time	Finish Time		
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT	08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT		

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 11	Item ID:	Line Qty:	125	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty:	125
Required: No	Reserve Price: No						

Description: 1/2" 4'x8' zip roof sheathing

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 12	Item ID:	Line Qty:	25	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty:	25
Required: No	Reserve Price: No						

Description: zip roof system tape - 90'

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	7
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time		Finish Time	
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT		08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT	

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

No Bid: ☐

Line: 13 Item ID: Line Qty: 25 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 25
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 1"x50' filler rope

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 14 Item ID: Line Qty: 1 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 1/2" foam backer rod - 100'

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 15 Item ID: Line Qty: 150 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 150
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: DBL rebar chair - RC368EAR Steel

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	8
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time		Finish Time	
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT		08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT	

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 16	Item ID:	Line Qty: 5	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty: 5
Required: No	Reserve Price: No				

Description: 16 GA Annealed Tie Wire - 3.5#

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 17	Item ID:	Line Qty: 400	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty: 400
Required: No	Reserve Price: No				

Description: 5" reinforcing angle L50

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	9
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time		Finish Time	
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT		08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT	

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

No Bid: ☐

Line: 18 Item ID: Line Qty: 114 UOM: Bundle Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 114
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: OC Oakridge brownwood bundle

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 19 Item ID: Line Qty: 10 UOM: Bundle Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 10
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: OC supreme brownwood 25 yr/bundle

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 20 Item ID: Line Qty: 5 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty: 5
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: 1-1/2"x9 galv joist hang NL 5#

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	10
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New <u>Shelterhouse</u> Materials			
Start Time		Finish Time	
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT		08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT	

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 21	Item ID:	Line Qty: 5	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty: 5
Required: No	Reserve Price: No				

Description: 1-3/4" generic EG coil RFG 7.2M

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 22	Item ID:	Line Qty: 20	UOM: Each	Weighting: 4.17%	Bid Qty: 20
Required: No	Reserve Price: No				

Description: Brn alum roof edge 1-3/4"10'

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	11
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New <u>Shelterhouse</u> Materials			
Start Time		Finish Time	
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT		08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT	

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

No Bid: ☐

Line: 23 Item ID: Line Qty: 4 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty:
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Ventsure 20' roll ridge vent

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	<input type="text"/>

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

No Bid: ☐

Line: 24 Item ID: Line Qty: 1 UOM: Each Weighting: 4.17% Bid Qty:
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: Delivery

Comments:
- All items delivered to:

IDNR, Div. Of Forestry
Morgan Monroe State Forest
6220 FOREST RD
MARTINSVILLE, IN 4615>>

Question	UOM	Best	Worst	Weighting	Response
What is your quote/bid price?				100%	<input type="text"/>

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments

Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID	Format	Type	Page
00300-0000084833	Buy	RFx	12
Event Round	Version		
1	1		
Event Name			
New Shelterhouse Materials			
Start Time	Finish Time		
07/29/2025 07:08:34 EDT	08/29/2025 10:00:00 EDT		

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bidder: INTERNAL EVENT DETAILS
Submit To: Natural Resources
Indiana Dept of Natural Resources
Budget & Support
402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W263
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
United States
Contact: Kathy Evans - 00300
Phone:
Email: kmevans@dnr.in.gov

Bidder Information

Firm Name:		
Name:	Signature:	Date:
Phone #:	Fax #:	
Street Address:		
City & State:	Zip Code:	
Email:		